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41676 - 23/24 

GENERAL 
SERVICES 
AGENCY - CITY 
ADMIN 

$800,000.00 

Contractor will perform natural areas management 
on Yerba Buena Island to include invasive plant 
removal and habitat restoration activities using hand 
and small-tool techniques. This work is to support 
the Yerba Buena Island (YBI) Habitat Management 
Plan, following pre-established site priorities 
developed by the Treasure Island Development 
Authority (TIDA). 

September 
30, 2023 

September 
30, 2027 REGULAR 

42481 - 23/24 

GENERAL 
SERVICES 
AGENCY - CITY 
ADMIN 

$300,000.00 

Vendor will perform as-needed specialized 
toxicological analyses. Tests will be performed for 
such substances such as synthetic cannabinoids, 
designer opiates, and bath salts. The Office of the 
Chief Medical Examiner (OCME) developed several 
leading analytical methods to detect, quantify and 
confirm over 450 common drugs of abuse, 
medications, poisons and novel psychoactive drugs. 
This is beyond national minimal standards and 
recommendations for decedents, impaired driving, 
and sexual assault casework. The capacity to perform 
these tests in-house has mitigated some of the 
additional work required during the City’s fentanyl 
drug overdose epidemic. However, an outside 
accredited laboratory contract is necessary to 
perform specialized work that OCME cannot do. 

December 
1, 2023 

December 
31, 2028 REGULAR 

https://apps.sfgov.org/dhrdrupal/regpscposting?order=title&sort=asc&field_csc_hearing_date_value%5Bvalue%5D%5Bdate%5D=2023-10-02
https://apps.sfgov.org/dhrdrupal/node/21217
https://apps.sfgov.org/dhrdrupal/node/21204
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45826 - 23/24 CONTROLLER $7,000,000.00 

The City seeks responses from Respondents to 
provide professional services for the following 
systems: 

PeopleSoft Financials and Supply Chain 
Management (FSCM); 

PeopleSoft Human Capital Management (HCM); 

PeopleSoft Enterprise Learning Management (ELM); 

Oracle Business Intelligence Applications (OBIA); 

Oracle Business Intelligence Enterprise Edition 
(OBIEE); 

Potential replacement systems for the above listed 
products; 

Potential change in infrastructure used to support the 
above listed products; and 

City legacy and related systems. 

Respondents must be able to provide functional, 
technical, and project management services for these 
systems both remotely and on-site at the Office of 
the Controller’s City Hall Office. 

These services will be used to assist the Controller’s 
Office and other City Departments with system 
enhancements, modifications, and additional systems 
support. 

November 
1, 2023 

October 
31, 2028 REGULAR 

32820 - 23/24 
MUNICIPAL 
TRANSPORTATION 
AGENCY 

$2,500,000.00 

The contractor will plan, coordinate, and conduct an 
in-person survey of the San Francisco Municipal 
Transportation Agency's (SFMTA) transit riders to 
collect data on their demographics and transportation 
practices. The consultant will collect statistically 

January 1, 
2024 

December 
31, 2025 REGULAR 

https://apps.sfgov.org/dhrdrupal/regpscposting?order=title&sort=asc&field_csc_hearing_date_value%5Bvalue%5D%5Bdate%5D=2023-10-02
https://apps.sfgov.org/dhrdrupal/node/21189
https://apps.sfgov.org/dhrdrupal/node/21200
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significant data about customer travel patterns, 
income levels, ethnic background, language 
proficiency, and fare media usage both on a temporal 
and geographic basis. Riders will be surveyed on all 
routes and modes of transit vehicles, on platforms, 
and by telephone as necessary. The consultant shall 
produce a final report that includes a discussion of 
the survey results and relevant high-level data 
summaries. 

35159 - 23/24 
MUNICIPAL 
TRANSPORTATION 
AGENCY 

$2,000,000.00 

The U.S. Department of Transportation (USDOT) 
awarded the San Francisco Municipal Transportation 
Agency (SFMTA) $2 million from the SMART 
(Strengthening Mobility and Revolutionizing 
Transportation) grants program to support the 
SFMTA’s Digital Curb project. The SMART grants 
program funds innovative approaches to using 
technology to solve transportation problems -- the 
Digital Curb project will create a first-of-its-kind 
citywide database and map of all curb locations and 
regulations, which will provide valuable information 
for the agency and public, and help achieve the 
agency’s curb management goals. 

The SFMTA intends to issue an RFP for a Contractor 
to support the Digital Curb project in assembling 
curb data for the first time by leveraging existing 
data and collecting data on the street using 
innovative digital mapping tools; keeping data up to 
date via software tools as SFMTA plans legislate, 
and implements curb regulation changes; and 
disseminating data via maps, analytical tools, and an 
open data feed using the Curb Data Specification 
(CDS) industry standard. 

September 
15, 2023 

September 
15, 2025 REGULAR 

https://apps.sfgov.org/dhrdrupal/regpscposting?order=title&sort=asc&field_csc_hearing_date_value%5Bvalue%5D%5Bdate%5D=2023-10-02
https://apps.sfgov.org/dhrdrupal/node/21212
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As part of the Digital Curb project, SFMTA will also 
partner with the Open Mobility Foundation (OMF). 
OMF is a non-profit organization that develops 
digital tools for public agencies and manages the 
CDS standard. OMF will make changes to CDS as 
necessary to support the Digital Curb project, as well 
as work with SFMTA and other cities with similar 
projects to document costs, benefits, lessons learned, 
and best practices, which will help SFMTA meet its 
grant obligations to USDOT. 

44669 - 22/23 

MUNICIPAL 
TRANSPORTATION 
AGENCY 

$250,000.00 
To provide federally mandated urine analysis for 
Safety-Sensitive employees with the San Francisco 
Municipal Transportation Agency (SFMTA). 

February 
1, 2024 

February 
1, 2029 REGULAR 

41458 - 23/24 PUBLIC UTILITIES 
COMMISSION $15,000,000.00 

Perform highly specialized engineering tasks that 
include conducting geotechnical field explorations, 
investigations, and laboratory testing; hydraulic 
modeling, seismic vulnerabilities of water treatment 
facilities and chemical storage tanks, site surveying 
in remote locations, reliability and maintenance 
issues with chemical pumps, preparing reports for 
new and existing facilities; The SFPUC intends to 
award one (1) contract, not to exceed $15,000,000. 

February 
1, 2024 

January 
31, 2035 REGULAR 

45295 - 23/24 SHERIFF $140,000.00 

The San Francisco Sheriff's Office proposes to enter 
into a contract for the garbage collection services for 
the San Francisco County Jail #3 located in San 
Bruno, CA, and to comply with the San Bruno 
Municipal Code 10.20.050, which the City of San 
Bruno issued an exclusive contract for the collection 
of garbage. 

October 1, 
2023 

September 
30, 2024 REGULAR 

https://apps.sfgov.org/dhrdrupal/regpscposting?order=title&sort=asc&field_csc_hearing_date_value%5Bvalue%5D%5Bdate%5D=2023-10-02
https://apps.sfgov.org/dhrdrupal/node/20976
https://apps.sfgov.org/dhrdrupal/node/21170
https://apps.sfgov.org/dhrdrupal/node/21221
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48964 - 23/24 

GENERAL 
SERVICES 
AGENCY - 
TECHNOLOGY 

$15,000,000.00 

Background: The City retired its physical mainframe 
equipment in 2022. While the City offers its own 
private City Cloud Platform, it must also offer Public 
Cloud Service options to those City departments who 
choose not to leverage the City's Cloud Services. In 
addition, the City needs Cloud Services from Public 
Web Services providers for the City to maintain 
redundancy and disaster recovery services. 

The Public Cloud Providers are expected to provide 
Cloud Technical Support and professional services to 
cover development and production issues for Cloud 
products and services, along with other key stack 
components: 

"How to" questions about Cloud services and 
features, 
Best practices to help successfully integrate, deploy, 
and manage applications in the cloud, 
Troubleshooting Application Programming Interface 
(API) and Software Development Kit (SDK) issues, 
Troubleshooting operational or systemic problems 
with Cloud resources, 
Issues with our Management Console or other Cloud 
tools, 
Problems detected by Cloud Providers health check 
tools, and f 
A number of third-party applications such as 
Operating System (OS), web servers, email, Virtual 
Private Network (VPN), databases, and storage 
configuration 

September 
1, 2023 

December 
31, 2030 REGULAR 

 
TOTAL AMOUNT $42,990,000 

 

https://apps.sfgov.org/dhrdrupal/regpscposting?order=title&sort=asc&field_csc_hearing_date_value%5Bvalue%5D%5Bdate%5D=2023-10-02
https://apps.sfgov.org/dhrdrupal/node/21172
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